Registered with the Registrar
of Newspapers for India under
No. 10410

Registered No.
PY/44/2021-23

i R
®
UG ECEM wrB STAHD
La Gazette de L' Etat de Poudoucheéery
The Gazette of Puducherry

PART - 11
Amrinj aeueflui® EXTRAORDINAIRE EXTRAORDINARY

B smrib GLimm Publiée par Published by
QareNuif® Autorité Authority
PEY yz15:Gaf aFaurwsSpmw 2022 @5° s 5 12 8
No. ~31 Poudouchéry Mardi 12 Juillet 2022
No. Puducherry Tuesday 12th July 2022
(21 Asadha 1944)

GOVERNMENT OF PUDUCHERRY
LABOUR DEPARTMENT

(G.O. Ms. No. 6/AIL/Lab./G/2022, Puducherry, dated 31st May 2022)

NOTIFICATION

The Draft of the following rules further to amend the Puducherry
Factories Rules, 1964, which the Lieutenant-Governor, Puducherry, has
proposed to make in exercise of the powers conferred under section 112
of the Factories Act, 1948 (Central Act No. 63 of 1948), is hereby
published as required under sub-section (1) of section 115 of the

[335]



336 LA GAZETTE DE L'ETAT [PArT-II

said Act (Central Act No. 63 of 1948) for information of all persons likely
to be affected thereby and notice is hereby given that the said Draft
Rules will be taken into consideration on the expiry of forty-five days
from the date of publication of this notification in the Official Gazette.

Objections and suggestions if any, may be addressed to Secretary
to Government, Labour Department, Government of Puducherry,
Puducherry (e-mail ID-Ic.pon@nic.in). The objections and suggestions
should be sent in a pro forma containing columns (i) specifying the
name and address of the persons and organizations and column (ii)
specifying the revised rule or sub-rule proposed to be submitted and
the reasons therefor;

Objections and suggestions, which may be received from any
person or organization with respect to the said Draft notification before
expiry of a period of 45 days, specified above, will be considered by the
Government of Puducherry.

DRAFT RULES

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) These rules may be called
the Puducherry Factories (Amendment) Rules, 2021.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication
in the Official Gazette.



337

LA GAZETTE DE L'ETAT

ParT-II]

DO0ZEYSH | DOBOYSY | ODOWHESH | DOD'OYESY | D00'SE'ESY | 000'0VZ'SY | 000'9T'Z%Y | 000'WZ'TSY | D00ZT'TSY | D00'9ssH | nooowsy Mz G0

g B TSN

DOO'BN'SH | ODPR'ESY | DDXOVESY | DO0'PEESY | DDOZL'ESY | DOO'ITZ'SY | 000TETSY | QOOEUTS | 000965 | 00D'DESY | 00095 | nanot own smag

) RO (K5 L DAY

SRl RSN

OO0'PHESH | ODOOS'ESY [ DOOMICESY | 0O0'ETESH | DOORE'TSY | D00'ZE'TSH | O0RYTSH | 000'065Y | 000'0FSY | 000'va'sy | DDOEwsH gL, oHdn s

. _ SEKIE (IS An0gy

] BRI

0O009'ESY | D0ODE'ESY [ DDOETESY | QO0'BEZSY | OO0PS'TSY | DOOEITSY | 0ODWFTEY | OOODESY | 000'%oSY | 0O0'EWSY | DDA'SZSH 1005 onln s

i SEMH (AT A0

i oo asmipg

ODUAE'ESH | DOITTESY [ DOOR'ESY | 000'WYZ5H | ODDOETSY | O00PRTSY | D000 TS | D00WIsY | 000'RFSY | ODO'SESY | ODR'ZTSY (30 enn sasag

A (01 ey

I BEIOE]

DOETESH | DDARRTSY | D0MPIESY | OODFZS | ODDIT'TSY | DODOZTSY | DOO'965H | DOOEVSY | 009'ST5Y | ODRZTSH | 0O0'ZTSY ()] i i

) LB (i AALy

W] BEIDH]

QO0'RRES | O00'va'E <Y | D00'0VT SN [ O00OT'ESY | 000'0E'LH | 00D'9E'SM | DOOZLSH | OO9SEEY | DDOOTSY | 0DDETSY | ooz 005 Sdn 2w

S (ST DA0gY

fap ; By| 3Emp

D00'FHEE | 0ODORERY | OODTZ5Y | O000RTSY | 0O0WFTSY | 0007E5Y | 0DD'EYSd | 00F'%T oDOZTSY | 00Z'ESH | D0Rvsd f52 ailn sasag

{3 S (57| 300y

DO0OP'ESH | DOD'ITTTY | 000'DETRY | 000'WE'ISY | ODO'BOTSY | DOO'BKSY | cORWZSM | 000TTSM | QDTS | 008%SE | DOZESH Lzhmrﬂmnpau

LN

OOFOTESY | DOO'DETH | 00OW'TSY | OOD'RO'TRY | ODOZLSY | OUWEZSH | DODWRTSY | 002YSH | 00B'VSH | DOC'ESH | DOKESH | msopgps owdn ey

_ RN ] sy

00008'T 5 | DOOVP'TSY | 0OBITSY | 000TLSH | ODUSWSH | DDUSTSY | 00B0TS |00GWSH | 0OZESY | 00VWESH | 009TSH S o

DODOETSY | DDO'9ESY | ODOOYSH | OOO'DESY | ODDPES | DOWOTSY | 00Z'@s¥  [ococesw  [oovrsy o090y | ooes S SR TR
R [{TiS 0] THEIE i 1) T [ &
.........mmm_.r gL .-_i._ .w_ Wn L ..._. T ......._.. l“.... ._..r.q .. .. ."|| “ (3 m._..m ... .... ... .._|.. il .r IL “k
A Emﬂﬁm_t :ER u.zﬁ.. i B E AT e e e Fs% um a...#_

L!_hviui..-q _..-ﬂh-. -cimn_n.ix #n-nr_umf_-nuﬂi;ninﬂﬂ_a &

31NQaHOS.
-Aipweu ‘panigsans aq ieys snpauag Bumoio) BU) ‘b ajny Jepun snpayds BunsiXa U 10} 'S3INI PIES U U| - SINI 0 JUSWPUBLIY g




338 LA GAZETTE DE L'ETAT [PArT-II

3. Amendment to rule 5.— In the said rules, in sub-rule (3) of
rule 5, for the words “fifty rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”
shall be substituted.

4. Amendment to rule 7.— In the said rules, in sub-rule (2) of
rule 7, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred
rupees” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment to rule 9.— In the said rules, in sub-rule 9 of
rule 7, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred
rupees” shall be substituted.

6. Amendment to rule 105.— In the said rules, in clause (a) of
sub - rule (2-A) of rule 105, for the letters, figures and words “rupees 50
per year per worker”, the letters, figures and words, “rupees 200 per year
per worker” shall be substituted.

(By order of the Lieutenant-Governor)

S.D. SUNDARESAN, 1.A.S.,
Secretary to Government (Labour).

online publication at “https://styandptg.py.gov.in”
Published by the Director, Government Press, Puducherry.



